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Minton Jones Sheffield The School Box Discount 
School Supply ACCO School 

Specialty
A + School 

Supply

Group Total Cost Group Total Cost Group Total Cost Group Total Cost Group Total Cost Group Total Cost Group Total Cost

Colored Paper $18,943.85 $25,822.40 $12,453.80/No Bid 
On Some Items NO BID NO BID Not Considered For 

Award
Not Considered For 

Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

50 Pound Kraft              
Butcher Paper                       $14,057.55 $25,649.70 $14,576.40 NO BID NO BID Not Considered For 

Award
Not Considered For 

Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

 Poster Board Paper   $832.00 NO BID $691.86 $77.86/No Bid on 
Some Items NO BID Not Considered For 

Award
Not Considered For 

Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

 3Hole Punched Filler Paper $103.50 $139.50 $98.10 NO BID NO BID Not Considered For 
Award

Not Considered For 
Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

8.5"x11"  Carbonless Paper $6,057.14 $6,709.93 NO BID  NO BID NO BID Not Considered For 
Award

Not Considered For 
Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Construction Paper $16,056.63 $8,995.40/No Bid On 
Some Items $12,980.95 $15,341.20/No Bid 

On Some Items NO BID Not Considered For 
Award

Not Considered For 
Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Laminating Film GBC $16,321.06 $38,295.37 $16,963.52 NO BID $13,031.92 Not Considered For 
Award

Not Considered For 
Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Laminating Film - Budget $40.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Not Considered For 
Award

Not Considered For 
Award

Notes
Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Unable to meet the mandatory 
requirements published in the 

bid document.

Notes

Minton Jones awarded 
Colored Paper, Butcher 

Paper, Carbonless 
Paper

N/A
The School Box 

awarded Poster Board, 
Filler Paper, 

Construction Paper

N/A ACCO awarded 
Laminating Film N/A N/A

B20-05, 
Miscellaneous Paper 
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